
Results of the 4-year COST Action, 
which involves partners from 43 
countries representing 209 
academic institutions 83 industries 
and 35 technical centres, will be 
presented.

as well-known scientific and 
industry members of the European 
COST Action FP1405 ActInPak will 
share interactive presentations and 
physical demonstrations of active 
and intelligent packaging.

ON NOVEMBER 21ST

The conference and fair program 
will soon be published on the 
ActInPak website where you can 
also read more about ActInPak.

Here, you will find the latest on 
novel innovations and market 
implementation of packaging that 
interacts with its contents (active) 
or communicates with its 
consumers (intelligent).

For more information, please visit  
the ActInPak LinkedIn page or 
Youtube channel. Follow us also on 
Facebook and Twitter.

http://www.actinpak.eu/actinpak-events/final-conference/
http://www.actinpak.eu/
https://www.linkedin.com/groups/8254568
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCpXTDD85oSNgqO5c0eOiU9Q/videos
https://twitter.com/ActInPak
https://www.facebook.com/Actinpak/
http://www.cost.eu/COST_Actions/fps/FP1405
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